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"It would be easy to simply dismiss [Paul] Kersey as a racist. But denouncing him or ignoring him is not
refuting him. Refuting requires thought, which has largely been replaced by fashionable buzzwords and
catchphrases when it comes to discussions of race. Thought is long overdue. So is honesty." -- Thomas
Sowell

You’ve seen HBO’s THE WIRE, created by former BALTIMORE SUN reporter David Simon.

You might even have read his book, HOMICIDE: A YEAR ON THE KILLING STREETS, and watched the
television show based upon it, HOMICIDE: LIFE ON THE STREET.

You’ve been conditioned by these and many other works to believe that the black crime and misery found in
Baltimore - “the Charm City”- are the result of the twin evils of drugs and white flight.

But what if that’s not true?

Baltimore was once one of America’s greatest cities.

During the 1910s, its white population passed some of the nation’s first racial segregation laws in an attempt
to keep Baltimore great. Those laws were later repealed. Today, 63 percent of Baltimore’s population is
black, and it has become a city of decaying houses, blighted neighborhoods, and one of the highest murder
rates in the nation.

Why the change? Could those segregation laws have had a basis in something other than hate? Could the
people of 1910 Baltimore have understood something about differences in racial behavior, differences
reflected in the despondent conditions of the city only one hundred years later.

In THE CITY THAT BLEEDS, Paul Kersey, author of ESCAPE FROM DETROIT, offers the reader a
fearless look at the city of Baltimore and the racial realities found there - realities that challenge the narrative
set forth by Simon and by those who would mythologize black pathologies in popular fiction like THE
WIRE.

THE CITY THAT BLEEDS is Paul Kersey’s most comprehensive portrait yet of a city where black pride
and black power combined have led to black political control - and to its disastrous consequences.

To paraphrase Sowell, it's the long overdue honesty America needs at this critical juncture in the country's
history.
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From reader reviews:

Terrie Delgadillo:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book The City that Bleeds: Race, History, and the Death of
Baltimore. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Provided that we know about how is
important a new book The City that Bleeds: Race, History, and the Death of Baltimore. You can add
information and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from
book you can understand everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About
simple factor until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can open a book as well as searching
by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's
examine.

Effie Peoples:

The ability that you get from The City that Bleeds: Race, History, and the Death of Baltimore will be the
more deep you rooting the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but The City that Bleeds: Race, History, and the Death of
Baltimore giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in specific way that
can be understood through anyone who read this because the author of this book is well-known enough. This
kind of book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go along,
both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this kind of The City that Bleeds:
Race, History, and the Death of Baltimore instantly.

Christina Webb:

The e-book untitled The City that Bleeds: Race, History, and the Death of Baltimore is the e-book that
recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you.
The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a
lot of exploration when write the book, so the information that they share to your account is absolutely
accurate. You also might get the e-book of The City that Bleeds: Race, History, and the Death of Baltimore
from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Wanda Hardin:

The e-book with title The City that Bleeds: Race, History, and the Death of Baltimore includes a lot of
information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This specific book exist new
expertise the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world right now. That is
important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you in new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.
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