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In this "essentials" gender text, Laura Kramer presents an overview of basic sociological concepts and
perspectives on gender in a concise, accessible format. With a focus on gender in the contemporary United
States, Kramer draw on a rich historical background to explain the many complex shifts that have occurred
within the gender system over time. She examines the macro-, middle-, and micro-level forces that propelled
these changes. Furthermore, the text explores the interaction of social structure and culture to reveal how
they have influenced men's and women's lives.

Throughout, the text investigates the changing definition of gender through the lenses of class and
race/ethnicity. Current research and in-depth historical coverage ensure that students understand the dynamic
nature of gender systems and the vital importance of social action.

The Sociology of Gender's explicitly sociological approach provides an alternative to--and critique of--
biological and psychological approaches to gender and sexual orientation. To encourage critical thinking,
Kramer analyzes both how and why biological and psychological approaches have become so popular.

A chapter on culture provides an in-depth examination of traditionally dominant versions of femininities and
masculinities and how they are communicated through language, mass media, and religion. The concept of
individual agency and resistance, introduced in the first chapter, resurfaces throughout in discussions of
culture and socialization. The second edition also features expanded coverage of religion, education, same-
sex relationships, and feminist activism.

A glossary and evocative discussion questions encourage students to interact with the material. Ideal for
introductory sociology courses and other courses in sociology, The Sociology of Gender provides a relevant,
comprehensive, and lively overview of this vibrant area of study.
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From reader reviews:

Rose Slagle:

In other case, little folks like to read book The Sociology of Gender: A Brief Introduction. You can choose
the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book The
Sociology of Gender: A Brief Introduction. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world
with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can recognize everything! From your country
until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you
may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or maybe searching by internet unit. It is called e-
book. You need to use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's study.

Jane Mansour:

This The Sociology of Gender: A Brief Introduction book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is definitely information inside this e-
book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you
will get. This specific The Sociology of Gender: A Brief Introduction without we know teach the one who
reading it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't be worry The Sociology of Gender: A Brief
Introduction can bring when you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' grow to be full because
you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This The Sociology of Gender: A Brief Introduction
having great arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Raymond Crandall:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new data. When
you read a book you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you
read this The Sociology of Gender: A Brief Introduction, you may tells your family, friends and also soon
about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a book.

Tony Hogan:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is referred to
as of book The Sociology of Gender: A Brief Introduction. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving
behind the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most significant that,
you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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