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Gone With The Wind is one of the most popular movies of all time. To commemorate its seventy-fifth
anniversary in 2014, The Making of Gone With The Wind presents more than 600 items from the archives of
David O. Selznick, the film's producer, and his business partner John Hay "Jock" Whitney, which are housed
at the Harry Ransom Center at the University of Texas at Austin. These rarely seen materials, which are also
being featured in a major 2014 exhibition at the Ransom Center, offer fans and film historians alike a must-
have behind-the-camera view of the production of this classic.

Before a single frame of film was shot, Gone With The Wind was embroiled in controversy. There were
serious concerns about how the film would depict race and violence in the Old South during the Civil War
and Reconstruction. While Clark Gable was almost everyone's choice to play Rhett Butler, there was no clear
favorite for Scarlett O'Hara. And then there was the huge challenge of turning Margaret Mitchell's Pulitzer
Prize–winning epic into a manageable screenplay and producing it at a reasonable cost. The Making of Gone
With The Wind tells these and other surprising stories with fascinating items from the Selznick archive,
including on-set photographs, storyboards, correspondence and fan mail, production records, audition
footage, gowns worn by Vivien Leigh as Scarlett, and Selznick's own notoriously detailed memos.

This inside view of the decisions and creative choices that shaped the production reaffirm that Gone With
The Wind is perhaps the quintessential film of Hollywood's Golden Age and illustrate why it remains
influential and controversial decades after it was released.
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From reader reviews:

Jason Manuel:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for us. The book The Making of Gone With The Wind had been
making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The e-book The Making of Gone With The Wind is not only giving you much more new
information but also being your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to
read your book. Try to make relationship using the book The Making of Gone With The Wind. You never
sense lose out for everything should you read some books.

Nellie Nelson:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take The Making of Gone With The Wind as your daily
resource information.

Ann Yoho:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the concept The Making of
Gone With The Wind suitable to you? The actual book was written by well-known writer in this era. The
book untitled The Making of Gone With The Windis the main of several books that will everyone read now.
This book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new
dimension that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their idea in the simple way, so all of people
can easily to be aware of the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lot of information about this
world now. In order to see the represented of the world with this book.

Amy Quist:

Beside this specific The Making of Gone With The Wind in your phone, it might give you a way to get
nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from
your oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow village. It is good
thing to have The Making of Gone With The Wind because this book offers to your account readable
information. Do you at times have book but you do not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that won't
happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss this? Find this book as well as read it from today!
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