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With unequaled authority and dramatic detail, the first volume of Charles Moore’s authorized biography of
Margaret Thatcher reveals as never before the early life, rise to power, and first years as prime minister of
the woman who transformed Britain and the world in the late twentieth century. Moore has had unique
access to all of Thatcher’s private and governmental papers, and interviewed her and her family extensively
for this book. Many of her former colleagues and intimates have also shared previously unseen papers,
diaries, and letters, and spoken frankly to him, knowing that what they revealed would not be published until
after her death. The book immediately supersedes all other biographies and sheds much new light on the
whole spectrum of British political life from Thatcher’s entry into Parliament in 1959 to what was arguably
the zenith of her power—victory in the Falklands in 1982.

Drawing on an extraordinary cache of letters to her sister Muriel, Moore illuminates Thatcher’s youth, her
relationship with her parents, and her early romantic attachments, including her first encounters with Denis
Thatcher and their courtship and marriage. Moore brilliantly depicts her determination and boldness from the
very beginning of her political career and gives the fullest account of her wresting the Tory leadership from
former prime minister Edward Heath at a moment when no senior figure in the party dared to challenge him.
His account of Thatcher’s dramatic relationship with Ronald Reagan is riveting. This book also explores in
compelling detail the obstacles and indignities that Thatcher encountered as a woman in what was still
overwhelmingly a man’s world.

Moore’s admiration for Thatcher is evident, yet his portrait is convincingly clear-eyed, conveying both how
remarkable she was and how infuriating she could be, her extraordinary grasp at mastering policy and what
needed to be done, and her surprising vulnerabilities. At the moment when Margaret Thatcher becomes a
part of history, Moore’s portrait enlivens her, compellingly re-creating the circumstances and experiences
that shaped one of the most significant world leaders of the postwar era. 
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From reader reviews:

Lucile Brown:

With other case, little folks like to read book Margaret Thatcher: From Grantham to the Falklands. You can
choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any book
Margaret Thatcher: From Grantham to the Falklands. You can add know-how and of course you can around
the world by just a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can realize everything! From your
country until finally foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple matter until wonderful
thing you can know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or maybe searching by internet product. It is
called e-book. You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Deborah Lake:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to
remain than other is high. In your case who want to start reading a book, we give you that Margaret
Thatcher: From Grantham to the Falklands book as beginner and daily reading publication. Why, because
this book is usually more than just a book.

Ollie Johnson:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Margaret Thatcher: From Grantham to
the Falklands, it is possible to enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still would like to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't understand it, oh come
on its named reading friends.

Omar Lamm:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also you know
that little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to something by book.
Numerous books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is niagra Margaret Thatcher:
From Grantham to the Falklands.
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