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Lord George Ashford III never asked to be born an Alpha, but while it makes him an undesirable to the
parents of most young beta nobles, it does have the advantage of allowing him the freedom to seek out
Omega prostitutes for his own pleasure. Billy is a young boy fresh from the countryside, making a living in
one of the capital's nicer brothels. He only vaguely knows what being an Omega really means, as he's never
even had his first Heat.

Enter Lord Ashford.

This story is a work of historical fantasy fiction approximately 7,500 words long, and contains detailed
descriptions of m/m sexual encounters as well as elements of BDSM.

Excerpt:

"Billy emitted a strangled gasp and then a muffled sound against George’s lips and then, finally, his body
began to relax and his mouth opened, lips parting to let George do with them as he pleased. His posture
melted, allowing George to pick up the boy by his hips and place him on the nearest flat surface, which
happened to be a cabinet of some kind.

“Ah, ah, please...” the boy whimpered when George bent to lick at the boy’s neck, bite at his jaw line, rub his
cheek against that smooth skin."
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From reader reviews:

Kim Bartlett:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book allowed The
Perfect Omega (an Alpha/Omega historical novel)? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You know beside
you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it
is opinion or you have additional opinion?

Corey Ison:

Typically the book The Perfect Omega (an Alpha/Omega historical novel) has a lot associated with on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was written by the very famous author.
Mcdougal makes some research before write this book. This book very easy to read you can get the point
easily after looking over this book.

Jack Michaud:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a publication we can know
everything you want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This book The Perfect Omega (an Alpha/Omega historical novel) was filled regarding
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has diverse
feel when they reading the book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can sense enjoy to read
a book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you just wanted.

Claudia Kelley:

E-book is one of source of information. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the up-date information of year to year. As we know
those books have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. By book The Perfect Omega (an Alpha/Omega historical novel) we can acquire more advantage.
Don't you to definitely be creative people? To become creative person must choose to read a book. Merely
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with that book
The Perfect Omega (an Alpha/Omega historical novel). You can more attractive than now.
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