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In his poetry Walt Whitman set out to encompass all of America and in so doing heal its deepening divisions.
This magisterial biography demonstrates the epic scale of his achievement, as well as the dreams and
anxieties that impelled it, for it places the poet securely within the political and cultural context of his age.

Combing through the full range of Whitman's writing, David Reynolds shows how Whitman gathered
inspiration from every stratum of nineteenth-century American life: the convulsions of slavery and
depression; the raffish dandyism of the Bowery "b'hoys"; the exuberant rhetoric of actors, orators, and
divines. We see how Whitman reconciled his own sexuality with contemporary social mores and how his
energetic courtship of the public presaged the vogues of advertising and celebrity. Brilliantly researched,
captivatingly told, Walt Whitman's America is a triumphant work of scholarship that breathes new life into
the biographical genre.
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From reader reviews:

Angel Huitt:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information mainly because book is one of various ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially fictional book the author will bring that you imagine the
story how the figures do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you read
this Walt Whitman's America: A Cultural Biography, it is possible to tells your family, friends in addition to
soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a book.

Marquita Oswald:

The reason? Because this Walt Whitman's America: A Cultural Biography is an unordinary book that the
inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret the idea inside. Reading
this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such awesome way makes the
content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is
good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give
you a lot of rewards than the other book include such as help improving your proficiency and your critical
thinking technique. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to the reserve store
hurriedly.

Sally Norman:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because all this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
read. Walt Whitman's America: A Cultural Biography can be your answer because it can be read by an
individual who have those short extra time problems.

Hubert Macarthur:

Guide is one of source of know-how. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen will need book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those ebooks have
many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. Through the book Walt
Whitman's America: A Cultural Biography we can get more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative
people? For being creative person must choose to read a book. Simply choose the best book that acceptable
with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that book Walt Whitman's America: A
Cultural Biography. You can more desirable than now.
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