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Routledge Introductions to Applied Linguistics is a series of introductory level textbooks covering the core
topics in Applied Linguistics, primarily designed for those beginning postgraduate studies, or taking an
introductory MA course as well as advanced undergraduates. Titles in the series are also ideal for language
professionals returning to academic study.

The books take an innovative ‘practice-to-theory’ approach, with a 'back-to-front' structure. This leads the
reader from real-world problems and issues, through a discussion of intervention and how to engage with
these concerns, before finally relating these practical issues to theoretical foundations. Additional features
include tasks with commentaries, a glossary of key terms, and an annotated further reading section.

Exploring Professional Communication provides an accessible overview of the vast field of communication
in professional contexts from an applied linguistics perspective. It explores the nature of professional
communication by discussing various fundamental topics relevant for an understanding of this area.

The book is divided into eight chapters, each dealing with a specific area of professional communication,
such as genres of professional communication, identities in the workplace, and key issues of gender,
leadership and culture. Although the book’s main approach to professional communication is an applied
linguistics one, it also draws on insights from a range of other disciplines.

Throughout, Stephanie Schnurr takes an interactive approach that is reflected in the numerous examples of
authentic discourse data, from a variety of written and spoken contexts.

Exploring Professional Communication is critical reading for postgraduate and upper undergraduate students
of applied linguistics and communication studies.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Huynh:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider
while those information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now could be taking seriously
which one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Exploring Professional Communication: Language
in Action (Routledge Introductions to Applied Linguistics) as the daily resource information.

Charlotte Womble:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
loved ones or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is look different
you can read any book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all
day every day to reading a reserve. The book Exploring Professional Communication: Language in Action
(Routledge Introductions to Applied Linguistics) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of
individuals who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. If you did not have
enough space bringing this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book
through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book provides high quality.

Emily Higginbotham:

You may spend your free time to read this book this guide. This Exploring Professional Communication:
Language in Action (Routledge Introductions to Applied Linguistics) is simple bringing you can read it in
the recreation area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not get much space to bring the actual
printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book
in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Monika Cunniff:

Beside that Exploring Professional Communication: Language in Action (Routledge Introductions to
Applied Linguistics) in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or data.
The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from oven so don't possibly be worry if you
feel like an aged people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Exploring Professional Communication:
Language in Action (Routledge Introductions to Applied Linguistics) because this book offers to you
readable information. Do you often have book but you don't get what it's all about. Oh come on, that would
not happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, such as
treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the idea? Find this book along with read it from
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