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"Never die easy. Why run out of bounds and die easy? Make that linebacker pay. It carries into all facets of
your life. It's okay to lose, to die, but don't die without trying, without giving it your best."

His legacy is towering. Walter Payton—the man they called Sweetness, for the way he ran—remains the
most prolific running back in the history of the National Football League, the star of the Chicago Bears' only
Super Bowl Championship, eleven times voted the most popular sports figure in Chicago's history. Off the
field, he was a devoted father whose charitable foundation benefited tens of thousands of children each year,
and who—faced with terminal liver disease—refused to use his celebrity to gain a preferential position for
organ donation. Walter Payton was not just a football hero; he was America's hero.
        Never Die Easy is Walter Payton's autobiography, told from the heart. Growing up poor in Mississippi,
he took up football to get girls' attention, and went on to become a Black College All-American at tiny
Jackson State (during which time he was also a finalist in a Soul Train dance contest). Drafted by the Bears
in 1975, he predicted that he would last only five years but went on to play thirteen extraordinary seasons, a
career earning him regular acknowledgment as one of the greatest players in the history of professional
football. And when his playing days were over, he approached business and charity endeavors with the same
determination and success he had brought to the football field, always putting first his devotion to friends
and family. His ultimate battle with illness truly proved him the champion he always had been and prompted
a staggering outpouring of love and support from hundreds of thousands of friends and admirers.
        Written with veteran journalist and author Don Yaeger in the last weeks of Walter Payton's life, Never
Die Easy presents Walter's singular voice—warm, plainspoken, funny, self-aware—along with the voices of
the friends, family, teammates, and business associates who knew him best at all stages of his life, including
his wife, Connie, and their children, Brittney and Jarrett; his teammate and friend Matt Suhey; former Bears
head coach Mike Ditka; and many, many others.
        Walter made Don Yaeger promise that his book would be "inspirational and leave people with some
kind of lesson . . . and make sure you spell all the words right." Never Die Easy keeps all those promises.
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From reader reviews:

Cheryl Steele:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they get because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man feel need book once they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Never Die Easy: The Autobiography of Walter Payton.

Terry Crabtree:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Never Die Easy: The
Autobiography of Walter Payton book because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the
information in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Evan Reyes:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now could be taking seriously
which one would work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Never Die Easy: The Autobiography of Walter Payton as
your daily resource information.

Dennis Haney:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, limited story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Never Die Easy: The
Autobiography of Walter Payton that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by simply reading this
book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world a great deal
better then how they react towards the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading practice only for
the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want
to start studying as your good habit, you may pick Never Die Easy: The Autobiography of Walter Payton
become your personal starter.
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