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This historic book may have numerous typos and missing text. Purchasers can usually download a free
scanned copy of the original book (without typos) from the publisher. Not indexed. Not illustrated. 1830
edition. Excerpt: ... APPENDIX, PIECES SPOKEN AT PUBLIC EXAMINATIONS, &c. The following
address was delivered at the opening of an annual Examination, held at the New-York (Free now) Public
School room, Chatham-street, April 7th, 1818, by one of the pupils,--written by a gentleman of this city, for
the occasion :-- Respected Friends, It is a number of years since, by the benevolence of the New-York
Society, for promoting the Manumission of slaves, with the assistance of several humane individuals, a
school was established in this city, for the purpose of combining the influence of knowledge, with the
progress of emancipation, and of qualifying the ignorant descendants of a despised and enslaved race, to
become useful members of a free and enlightened community. By the firm support of that Society and its
friends, and the aid granted by the State Legislature, the school has increased in numbers and in character;
and now invites the candid and indulgent attention of this respectable audience, to its anniversary
examination. Slow as our advances have been in the path of knowledge, and humble as our exercises must
necessarily appear, we yet fondly hope to show, on this occasion, that we have not despised our privileges;
and that a dark complexion, although almost synonymous with bondage, does not betoken a mind incapable
of improvement. Those who now honor us with their attendance, are our friends and patrons. Their presence
is a pledge that they wish us well, and will animate us to new efforts to secure their favor, by endeavoring to
deserve it. Concluding address by a female on the same occasion. Respected Friends And Patrons, Permit
another of the African race to address you on this interesting occasion. When I consider the respectable and
philantrophic...
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From reader reviews:

Linda Long:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or read a book entitled The History of the New-
York African Free-Schools; From Their Establishment in 1787, to the Present Time; Embracing a Period of
More Than Forty Years? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your
time using your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have
additional opinion?

Carlos Terrill:

This The History of the New-York African Free-Schools; From Their Establishment in 1787, to the Present
Time; Embracing a Period of More Than Forty Years book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world
is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is information inside this e-book incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get.
This particular The History of the New-York African Free-Schools; From Their Establishment in 1787, to
the Present Time; Embracing a Period of More Than Forty Years without we comprehend teach the one who
reading it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry The History of the New-
York African Free-Schools; From Their Establishment in 1787, to the Present Time; Embracing a Period of
More Than Forty Years can bring once you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full
because you can have it in your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This The History of the New-York African
Free-Schools; From Their Establishment in 1787, to the Present Time; Embracing a Period of More Than
Forty Years having great arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in
reading.

William Carroll:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book in which improve
your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you read, if you want
send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want sense happy read one having theme for
entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual The History of the New-York African Free-Schools; From
Their Establishment in 1787, to the Present Time; Embracing a Period of More Than Forty Years is kind of
e-book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Joan Freeman:

Beside that The History of the New-York African Free-Schools; From Their Establishment in 1787, to the



Present Time; Embracing a Period of More Than Forty Years in your phone, it could possibly give you a
way to get more close to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got
here is fresh from the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow
commune. It is good thing to have The History of the New-York African Free-Schools; From Their
Establishment in 1787, to the Present Time; Embracing a Period of More Than Forty Years because this
book offers to you readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you do not get what it's exactly
about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot
be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book and
read it from now!
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