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of the original book (without typos) from the publisher. Not indexed. Not illustrated. 1902 edition. Excerpt:
...made concerning rings in Philadelphia, and to his introduction the suggestion of choosing brethren from
various parts of the country to make the Board of Directors; but, said he, the steps which might have been
taken by this A. M. C. might have culminated into the formation of the most fearful and corrupt ring that we
can well conceive of. All the moneys and interests passes through their hands, and is done by the S. C. of M.
For an entire year they have perfect immunity to fix and arrange plans to injure and destroy the Order, spend
its money, and then all they have to do is to have themselves elected delegates from the lodges, and bring to
bear their concerted influences upon the A. M. C., and thus hide and cover up their misdoings. The G. M.
thanked God for the action of A. M. C. of 1873, and thanked Brother Lewis, of Terry Lodge, for having
called his attention to the law, for the Order has had a narrow escape from a vortex--a whirlpool--which
eventually might have destroyed it. And now, in view of the action of the A. M. C. of 1873, on proposition
from Phoenix Lodge, 894, of Philadelphia, we declare the resolution offered to admit delegate from Lodge
891, out of order; and so we rule. In July, 1886, Ex-Grand Master Edward Sewell, Esq., of England, paid a
visit to America, and brought with him the fraternal greetings of our brethren on the other side of the
Atlantic. Grand Master Faucett, in his annual address made the following allusion to this distinguished
visitor: We stated in the early stage of our remarks, that this year had been very eventful in the history of our
Order. One of such events was the visit paid to the Order and S. C. of M. by Ex-Grand Master Edward
Sewell, Esq., of the Committee of Management, Leeds, England. This most...
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From reader reviews:

Sally Staten:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. Think about the person who
don't like reading through a book? Sometime, individual feel need book whenever they found difficult
problem or perhaps exercise. Well, probably you should have this The official history and manual of the
Grand United Order of Odd Fellows in America; a chronological treatise.

Beth Kelly:

Inside other case, little individuals like to read book The official history and manual of the Grand United
Order of Odd Fellows in America; a chronological treatise. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer
reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a new book The official history and manual of
the Grand United Order of Odd Fellows in America; a chronological treatise. You can add expertise and of
course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can realize
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we can open a book or even searching by internet
gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's read.

Jean Hogue:

Here thing why that The official history and manual of the Grand United Order of Odd Fellows in America;
a chronological treatise are different and reputable to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good
nonetheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is as scrumptious as food or not. The
official history and manual of the Grand United Order of Odd Fellows in America; a chronological treatise
giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no e-book
that similar with The official history and manual of the Grand United Order of Odd Fellows in America; a
chronological treatise. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing
this happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like
in area, café, or even in your method home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted
book maybe the form of The official history and manual of the Grand United Order of Odd Fellows in
America; a chronological treatise in e-book can be your alternate.

Shirley Davenport:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is identified
as of book The official history and manual of the Grand United Order of Odd Fellows in America; a



chronological treatise. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it
could add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about e-
book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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