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THE FEEL GOOD STORY OF THE YEAR After five years of waiting and suffering with poor vision and
Cataracts disease, and unable to get affordable Health Insurance coverage, 48 years "Young" self-employed
business owner, screenwriter, author, film maker, Biographer, Accountant, golfer and movie fan Randolph
M. Hirsch finally said to himself: "This is the Year to get things done." For years, because of a pre-existing
condition and unable to afford the expensive insurance rates that were being quoted to him, and being turned
down by the big Insurance companies, Randy contacted a friend asking for a referral to a local Health
insurance agent. At the last minute, Randy enrolled in the Affordable Health care covered plan, on the due
date of April 15th, 2014 and was fully covered! MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama
Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the
Affordable Health Insurance Act did for me." Is about his story and what Obama Care did for him and his
family... This book is for every person in America who is self employed and doesn't have any insurance
coverage yet. Why is it so important? Find out in Mr. Hirsch's new Book. DEDICATED TO AND
WRITTEN ESPECIALLY FOR ALL SELF EMPLOYED PEOPLE AND SMALL BUSINESS OWNERS
ACROSS THE COUNTRY WHO CURRENTLY DON'T HAVE ANY HEALTH INSURANCE
COVERAGE. This book is specifically targeted to: Self employed people across the country Small business
owners in the USA Independent Insurance Agents all across this great country of ours wanting to offer the
Obama Care Health plan and insurance coverage to their self employed clients Any part-time or full-time
employees who work for small business owners that don't offer any Health Insurance benefits Golfers and
Accountants Nationwide who are interested in Affordable Health Insurance coverage! Anyone who has had a
recent medical scare or procedure done, that didn't have any insurance -- and does not want to go through
anything like that again --without proper Insurance! Any person suffering from Cataracts disease or other
illnesses, who cannot afford the necessary treatment or surgery and doesn’t have proper Health Insurance
coverage. The miraculous story of how the Obama Health care phenomenon enabled one small business
owner, weekend dad to get Health Insurance coverage and get the cataracts eye surgery he needed. A
touching, Important and very Informative book: WRITTEN ESPECIALLY FOR ALL SELF EMPLOYED
PEOPLE AND SMALL BUSINESS OWNERS ACROSS THE COUNTRY WHO CURRENTLY DON'T
HAVE ANY HEALTH INSURANCE COVERAGE. Michael the Carpet Cleaner: "Your eyes are so crystal
clear and sparkly... I'm Jealous!" Randy: "Thanks." Michael the Carpet Cleaner: "Mr. Obama really hooked
you up." Randy: "Yes he did!" Help Spread the word: Buy five copies of Randy's book today. Moshe
Publications, Inc. 18375 Ventura Blvd. Suite #526 Tarzana, CA 91356
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From reader reviews:

Stevie Mozingo:

The book MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue
Shield Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the ... the U.S. with no Health insurance currently
can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So just why
must we leave the good thing like a book MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama
Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the ... the
U.S. with no Health insurance currently? A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim in
which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with the book.
Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for each other; you may share all of these. Book
MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield
Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the ... the U.S. with no Health insurance currently has
simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appearance the enormous
world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Marvin Murphy:

This MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield
Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the ... the U.S. with no Health insurance currently book
is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading
this book will be information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper an
individual read a lot of information you will get. That MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the
Obama Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the
... the U.S. with no Health insurance currently without we recognize teach the one who examining it become
critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't be worry MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama
Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the ... the
U.S. with no Health insurance currently can bring whenever you are and not make your handbag space or
bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even telephone. This
MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield
Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the ... the U.S. with no Health insurance currently
having fine arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

David Gonzales:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This book MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama Administration,
Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the ... the U.S. with no
Health insurance currently was filled in relation to science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about
your technology competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading the book. If you know how
big good thing about a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many



ways to get book that you wanted.

Sheila Whitley:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is created or printed or created from each source that will filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in search
of the MIRACULOUS! A Very Special Thanks to the Obama Administration, Hillary Clinton, Blue Shield
Insurance and Dr. Brad Elkins, Eye Surgeon: "What the ... the U.S. with no Health insurance currently when
you desired it?
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