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This is a reprint of the classic first published in 1957. One of the authors, Raymond Beverton, recently died.
His co-author, Sidney Holt, has written a new Foreword to this printing in which he reviews events in
fisheries research and management through the past 50 years as these relate to their joint work. On the
Dynamics of Exploited Fish Populations has become the most widely cited fisheries book ever published and
the fact that the bulk of the information contained within its covers is still valid has led to this reprinting.
Beverton and Holt's great work created a solid foundation for one of the two major global visions of the
science of fisheries. This book was the genesis of the modern age-structured approach to the optimal
management of fishery resources. Their approach led directly to a formulation of the fishery catch equation
with almost universal applicability. Its advantage was that it produced easily interpreted outputs that could be
clearly and directly applied to any fishery. Ultimately, this approach was the forerunner to VPA and allied
techniques, the core of modern catch forecasting used in setting quotas and in managing commercial
fisheries worldwide. Although the perception of the objectives of fisheries research has changed since the
1950s, and computers now enable calculations, data analysis, and theoretical exploration far beyond their
capability at the time, Beverton and Holt will continue to be a source of inspiration and insight for many
years to come. Sidney J. Holt was educated at Reading University, England. He has held academic positions
at St John's College, Cambridge, England; University of California at Santa Cruz; University of Rhode
Island; University of Malta. He is the author of 400 scientific papers, book chapters and popular articles,
especially in the fields of fisheries science and management, conservation, protection of marine mammals,
especially whales. He served 25 years in the United Nations system of Specialised Agencies (including the
FAO in Rome, UNESCO as Secretary of the Intergovernmental Oceanographic Commission and Director of
Division of Marine Science; Marine Mammals; Advisor to the United Nations Environment Programme; UN
Adviser on Mediterranean Marine Affairs, in which capacity he founded and served as first Director of, the
International Ocean Institute, in Malta). Since his formal retirement Dr Holt has served on the delegations of
Italy and of the Republic of Seychelles to the International Whaling Commission, and also as adviser to the
delegations of France and Chile. Dr Holt has worked extensively with several Non-Governmental
Organisations concerned with marine conservation. Apart from continuing to write and campaign Dr Holt
advises the Third Millennium Foundation, and serves as Executive Director of the International League for
the Protection of Cetaceans, which he founded 18 years ago.
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From reader reviews:

Louis Watson:

The book On the Dynamics of Exploited Fish Populations can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. So why must we leave a very important thing like a book On the Dynamics of
Exploited Fish Populations? A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim that book can
give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you could give for each other; it is possible to share all of these.
Book On the Dynamics of Exploited Fish Populations has simple shape however, you know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Dora Bair:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster.
And you have extra time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. The doctor has to answer
that question due to the fact just their can do that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person.
Yes, it is correct. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of On the Dynamics
of Exploited Fish Populations to read.

Noel Klein:

The book with title On the Dynamics of Exploited Fish Populations has lot of information that you can study
it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the information
that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to find
out how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the syndication.
You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Gerald McMullen:

The book untitled On the Dynamics of Exploited Fish Populations contain a lot of information on the idea.
The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy technique. The language is very straightforward all the
people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored by famous author. The
author provides you in the new period of literary works. You can read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation
you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice read.
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