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The Supreme Allied Commander who directed and won NATO's war in Kosovo offers a unique behind-the-
scenes look at how the war was actually fought, and explains the conflict's surprising implications for how
war will be waged in the decades to come. Ugly, shocking, frightening, war came to Europe once more in
March 1999. The world watched in dismay as Yugoslavia's military machine attacked its own citizens in the
province of Kosovo. Pictures of refugees fleeing and stories of murder and rape flashed to the top of the
news. But this time, the United States and its allies intervened. Using an innovative, high-technology air
operation, NATO brought modern military power to bear against Serb forces in the field and the machinery
of repression that backed them up. It was modern war-limited in scope, measured in effect, extraordinarily
complex in execution. The American commander who oversaw this massive military effort and managed the
often incompatible demands of NATO's nineteen governments was General Wesley K. Clark. In Waging
Modern War, Clark recounts not only the events that led to armed conflict, but also the context within which
he made the key strategic decisions. He also describes, for the first time, the personal conflict he felt as he
walked the tightrope of high diplomacy and military strategy and navigated the crushing restraints of
domestic politics. Laying out the new realities of war-fighting and war-planning, Clark reveals how the
American military infrastructure will have to adapt if it is to meet new threats. This is the story of war today,
and as it will be fought tomorrow.
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From reader reviews:

Roberto Fetter:

The book Waging Modern War: Bosnia, Kosovo, and the Future of Combat can give more knowledge and
also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a
book Waging Modern War: Bosnia, Kosovo, and the Future of Combat? A few of you have a different
opinion about reserve. But one aim that will book can give many information for us. It is absolutely right.
Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you are able to
give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Waging Modern War: Bosnia, Kosovo, and the
Future of Combat has simple shape however, you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can
seem the enormous world by available and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Cameron Rodriquez:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world
could share their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their own reader with
their story as well as their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about
the knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of
them is this Waging Modern War: Bosnia, Kosovo, and the Future of Combat.

Jacqueline Harding:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Waging Modern War: Bosnia, Kosovo, and the
Future of Combat, you may enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still would like to miss it? What
kind of hangout type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on
its identified as reading friends.

Victor Havens:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will
get it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. That Waging Modern War: Bosnia, Kosovo, and the
Future of Combat can give you a lot of close friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have
issue that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one
step for you to get success. This book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by
knowing more than other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have Waging
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