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An enterprise architecture tries to describe and control an organisation’s structure, processes, applications,
systems and techniques in an integrated way. The unambiguous specification and description of components
and their relationships in such an architecture requires a coherent architecture modelling language.

Lankhorst and his co?authors present such an enterprise modelling language that captures the complexity of
architectural domains and their relations and allows the construction of integrated enterprise architecture
models. They provide architects with concrete instruments that improve their architectural practice. As this is
not enough, they additionally present techniques and heuristics for communicating with all relevant
stakeholders about these architectures. Since an architecture model is useful not only for providing insight
into the current or future situation but can also be used to evaluate the transition from ‘as?is’ to ‘to?be’, the
authors also describe analysis methods for assessing both the qualitative impact of changes to an architecture
and the quantitative aspects of architectures, such as performance and cost issues.

The modelling language presented has been proven in practice in many real?life case studies and has been
adopted by The Open Group as an international standard. So this book is an ideal companion for enterprise
IT or business architects in industry as well as for computer or management science students studying the
field of enterprise architecture.
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From reader reviews:

Jill Barks:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill
your own free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your totally free time/ holiday. The
first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the publication untitled Enterprise Architecture at Work: Modelling, Communication and
Analysis (The Enterprise Engineering Series) can be good book to read. May be it might be best activity to
you.

Rocio Linville:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled Enterprise Architecture at Work: Modelling, Communication and Analysis (The Enterprise
Engineering Series) the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe
unknown for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a e-book then become
one contact form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get just before. The Enterprise
Architecture at Work: Modelling, Communication and Analysis (The Enterprise Engineering Series) giving
you yet another experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful details for your better
life on this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will probably be
pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary
spending spare time activity?

Sarah Porter:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not seeking Enterprise Architecture
at Work: Modelling, Communication and Analysis (The Enterprise Engineering Series) that give your
pleasure preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be
said as the means for people to know world far better then how they react toward the world. It can't be
mentioned constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants
to always be success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good habit, you could pick
Enterprise Architecture at Work: Modelling, Communication and Analysis (The Enterprise Engineering
Series) become your current starter.

Anthony Lainez:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to



can satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find guide that
need more time to be go through. Enterprise Architecture at Work: Modelling, Communication and Analysis
(The Enterprise Engineering Series) can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you who have
those short spare time problems.
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