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A visual romp through the world of epic fails, Fail Harder offers 200 fresh examples of what NOT to do in
every environment as based on the hugely successful (88 million page views per month) website failblog.org.

FAIL Harder follows the hilarious best-seller Fail Nation to showcase 200 original full-color photos of
world-wide FAILS based on the popular website failblog.org, the most visited member of the Cheezburger
Network.

So what qualifies as a FAIL? How about a nursery outfitted with a gun rack hanging over the baby's crib?
Perhaps the equation, "E=MC3" written on a classroom's write/erase board. What about a trifecta of beauty
parlor, chain saw repair, and nightclub housed inside an all-in-one-stop shop? 

Classic FAILs like these are presented in more than 15 different categories, including At Home, In A
Relationship, On the Job, and With Your Pets.

If you must FAIL, FAIL Harder.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Copeland:

Here thing why this Fail Harder: Ridiculous Illustrations of Epic Fails are different and dependable to be
yours. First of all studying a book is good but it really depends in the content of it which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. Fail Harder: Ridiculous Illustrations of Epic Fails giving you information deeper
since different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no book that similar with Fail
Harder: Ridiculous Illustrations of Epic Fails. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your personal
eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. You can
easily bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your technique home by train. If you are having
difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Fail Harder: Ridiculous Illustrations of Epic
Fails in e-book can be your choice.

Robert Johnson:

Often the book Fail Harder: Ridiculous Illustrations of Epic Fails will bring that you the new experience of
reading any book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to see,
this book very acceptable to you. The book Fail Harder: Ridiculous Illustrations of Epic Fails is much
recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can more readily
to read the book.

Charles Montiel:

The publication untitled Fail Harder: Ridiculous Illustrations of Epic Fails is the guide that recommended to
you to read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to an individual. The language
that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, and so the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You
also might get the e-book of Fail Harder: Ridiculous Illustrations of Epic Fails from the publisher to make
you much more enjoy free time.

Salvador Perez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you
also know that little person like reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by book. Many
kinds of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is this Fail Harder: Ridiculous
Illustrations of Epic Fails.
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