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In 1952 C. G. Jung published a paradoxical hypothesis on synchronicity that marked an attempt to expand
the western world’s conception of the relationship between nature and the psyche. Jung’s hypothesis sought
to break down the polarizing cause-effect assessment of the world and psyche, suggesting that everything is
interconnected. Thus, synchronicity is both "a meaningful event" and "an acausal connecting principle."
Evaluating the world in this manner opened the door to "exploring the possibility of meaning in chance or
random events, deciphering if and when meaning might be present even if outside conscious awareness."

Now, after contextualizing Jung’s work in relation to contemporary scientific advancements such as
relativity and quantum theories, Joseph Cambray explores in this book how Jung’s theories, practices, and
clinical methods influenced the current field of complexity theory, which works with a paradox similar to
Jung’s synchronicity: the importance of symmetry as well as the need to break that symmetry for
"emergence" to occur. Finally, Cambray provides his unique contribution to the field by attempting to trace
"cultural synchronicities," a reconsideration of historical events in terms of their synchronistic aspects. For
example, he examines the emergence of democracy in ancient Greece in order "to find a model of group
decision making based on emergentist principles with a synchronistic core."
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From reader reviews:

Johnny Cervantes:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not need people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Synchronicity: Nature and Psyche in
an Interconnected Universe (Carolyn and Ernest Fay Series in Analytical Psychology) book because book
offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred per cent guarantees
there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Ida Shrout:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Books can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their reader with their story or
their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the ability about
something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are
many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their ability in writing,
they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of them is this Synchronicity:
Nature and Psyche in an Interconnected Universe (Carolyn and Ernest Fay Series in Analytical Psychology).

Jesus Allgood:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer might be Synchronicity: Nature and Psyche in an Interconnected
Universe (Carolyn and Ernest Fay Series in Analytical Psychology) why because the amazing cover that
make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is actually fantastic
as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Delbert Storey:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you learn a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and
also soon. The Synchronicity: Nature and Psyche in an Interconnected Universe (Carolyn and Ernest Fay
Series in Analytical Psychology) offer you a new experience in reading a book.
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