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Over the past decades, governments have increasingly been confronted with problems that transcend their
boundaries. A multitude of policy fields are affected, including environment, trade and security. Responding
to the challenges triggered by Europeanization and globalization, governments increasingly interact across
different spheres of authority. Both theoretically and empirically, the puzzle of institutional choice reflected
by the variety of arrangements in which intergovernmental cooperation takes place inside individual
countries and across their borders remains surprisingly under-explored. In an attempt to solve this puzzle, the
book tackles the following questions: Why are the intergovernmental arrangements governments set up to
deal with boundary-crossing problems so different? To what extent do these institutional differences affect
the effectiveness of intergovernmental cooperation? To address this gap theoretically and empirically, this
book adopts a deductive, rationalist approach to institution-building. It argues that internal politics, the type
of executive-legislative relations within the interacting governments, explains the nature of institutions set up
to channel intergovernmental processes: while power-sharing governments engage in institution-building,
power-concentrating governments avoid it. It also shows that these institutional choices matter for the output
of intergovernmental cooperation. The approach is applied to Canada, Switzerland, the United States, and
finally the European Union. Disaggregating individual government units, the theoretical approach reveals
how intragovernmental micro-incentives drive macro-dynamics and thereby addresses the neglect of
horizontal dynamics in multilevel systems. The willingness and capacity of lower-level governments to solve
collective problems on their own and to oppose central encroachment are crucial to understand the power
distribution in different systems and their long-term evolutions.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Farr:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important normally. The book Intergovernmental Cooperation: Rational Choices
in Federal Systems and Beyond (Comparative Politics) was making you to know about other know-how and
of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you. The guide Intergovernmental
Cooperation: Rational Choices in Federal Systems and Beyond (Comparative Politics) is not only giving you
much more new information but also to be your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your
spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship with all the book Intergovernmental Cooperation:
Rational Choices in Federal Systems and Beyond (Comparative Politics). You never feel lose out for
everything in the event you read some books.

Celia Robertson:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in comparison
with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this time you only find publication that need
more time to be examine. Intergovernmental Cooperation: Rational Choices in Federal Systems and Beyond
(Comparative Politics) can be your answer given it can be read by you actually who have those short spare
time problems.

Patrick Allen:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This guide Intergovernmental Cooperation: Rational Choices in Federal
Systems and Beyond (Comparative Politics) was filled regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your
knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading some sort of
book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era
like now, many ways to get book you wanted.

Ross Turner:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. Therefore
you know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update in relation to something by
book. Many kinds of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is actually Intergovernmental
Cooperation: Rational Choices in Federal Systems and Beyond (Comparative Politics).
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