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“Dray captures the genius and ingenuity of Franklin’s scientific thinking and then does something even more
fascinating: He shows how science shaped his diplomacy, politics, and Enlightenment philosophy.”
–Walter Isaacson, author of Benjamin Franklin: An American Life

Today we think of Benjamin Franklin as a founder of American independence who also dabbled in science.
But in Franklin’s day, the era of Enlightenment, long before he was an eminent statesman, he was famous for
his revolutionary scientific work. Pulitzer Prize finalist Philip Dray uses the evolution of Franklin’s scientific
curiosity and empirical thinking as a metaphor for America’s struggle to establish its fundamental values. He
recounts how Franklin unlocked one of the greatest natural mysteries of his day, the seemingly unknowable
powers of lightning and electricity. Rich in historical detail and based on numerous primary sources, Stealing
God’s Thunder is a fascinating original look at one of our most beloved and complex founding fathers.
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From reader reviews:

Lana Alvis:

The experience that you get from Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's Lightning Rod and the
Invention of America is a more deep you rooting the information that hide within the words the more you get
considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin
Franklin's Lightning Rod and the Invention of America giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer
conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by simply anyone who read this because the author
of this reserve is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. It
is therefore easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
recommend you for having that Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's Lightning Rod and the
Invention of America instantly.

Peter Gomez:

This book untitled Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's Lightning Rod and the Invention of America
to be one of several books which best seller in this year, this is because when you read this reserve you can
get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retailer or you can order it by using
online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can
read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for you to past this book from your list.

Anthony Rouse:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire all their reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try
to improve their ability in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One
of them is this Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's Lightning Rod and the Invention of America.

Miranda Wenger:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's Lightning Rod and the
Invention of America this book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This
kind of book was represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer value to explain



it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why
this book acceptable all of you.
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