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In this expansive and contemplative history of Cuba, Louis A. Perez Jr. argues that the country's memory of
the past served to transform its unfinished nineteenth-century liberation project into a twentieth-century
revolutionary metaphysics. The ideal of national sovereignty that was anticipated as the outcome of Spain's
defeat in 1898 was heavily compromised by the U.S. military intervention that immediately followed. To
many Cubans it seemed almost as if the new nation had been overtaken by another country's history.
Memory of thwarted independence and aggrievement--of the promise of sovereignty ever receding into the
future--contributed to the development in the early republic of a political culture shaped by aspirations to
fulfill the nineteenth-century promise of liberation, and it was central to the claim of the revolution of 1959
as the triumph of history. In this capstone book, Perez discerns in the Cuban past the promise that decisively
shaped the character of Cuban nationality.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Bell:

The e-book untitled The Structure of Cuban History: Meanings and Purpose of the Past is the guide that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person.
The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy
writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, and so the information that they share for your
requirements is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of The Structure of Cuban History:
Meanings and Purpose of the Past from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Jennifer Garza:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its include may doesn't work
at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer is usually The Structure of Cuban History: Meanings and Purpose of the
Past why because the wonderful cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you
actually. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will
directly show you to pick up this book.

Melanie Pemberton:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many query for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes reading, not
only science book and also novel and The Structure of Cuban History: Meanings and Purpose of the Past or
perhaps others sources were given information for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you
feel desire to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher as well as students especially.
Those ebooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside science guide, any
other book likes The Structure of Cuban History: Meanings and Purpose of the Past to make your spare time
a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Thomas Baier:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that query was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you know
that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your own
personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book. Many kinds of
books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually The Structure of Cuban History:
Meanings and Purpose of the Past.
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