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From Book 1: If what you see is what you get, Jules is in serious trouble. The suspenseful first in a
series from the New York Times bestselling author of the Wake trilogy.

Jules lives with her family above their restaurant, which means she smells like pizza most of the time and
drives their double-meatball-shaped food truck to school. It’s not a recipe for popularity, but she can handle
that.

What she can’t handle is the recurring vision that haunts her. Over and over, Jules sees a careening truck hit
a building and explode...and nine body bags in the snow.

The vision is everywhere—on billboards, television screens, windows—and she’s the only one who sees it.
And the more she sees it, the more she sees. The vision is giving her clues, and soon Jules knows what she
has to do. Because now she can see the face in one of the body bags, and it’s someone she knows. Someone
she has been in love with for as long as she can remember.

In this riveting start to a gripping series from New York Times bestselling author Lisa McMann, Jules has to
act—and act fast—to keep her vision from becoming reality.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Alleman:

With other case, little men and women like to read book Visions (3 Book Series). You can choose the best
book if you appreciate reading a book. So long as we know about how is important some sort of book
Visions (3 Book Series). You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by way of a
book. Absolutely right, because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign or
abroad you will find yourself known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you could know that. In this
era, we can easily open a book or maybe searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You need to use it
when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's go through.

Charles Brewster:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this Visions
(3 Book Series), you may tells your family, friends along with soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge
can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a book.

Michael Jones:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire all their reader with their story or even
their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is this Visions
(3 Book Series).

Joseph Esparza:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got learners? We believe that that query
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also you
know that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by book. Numerous
books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually Visions (3 Book Series).
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