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From its beginnings in Twilight fan-fiction to its record-breaking sales as an e-book and paperback, the story
of the erotic romance novel Fifty Shades of Grey and its two sequels is both unusual and fascinating. Having
sold over seventy million copies worldwide since 2011, E. L. James’s lurid series about a sexual ingénue and
the powerful young entrepreneur who introduces her to BDSM sex has ingrained itself in our collective
consciousness. But why have these particular novels—poorly written and formulaic as they are—become so
popular, especially among women over thirty?
 
In this concise, engaging book, Eva Illouz subjects the Fifty Shades cultural phenomenon to the serious
scrutiny it has been begging for. After placing the trilogy in the context of best-seller publishing, she delves
into its remarkable appeal, seeking to understand the intense reading pleasure it provides and how that
resonates with the structure of relationships between men and women today. Fifty Shades, Illouz argues, is a
gothic romance adapted to modern times in which sexuality is both a source of division between men and
women and a site to orchestrate their reconciliation. As for the novels’ notorious depictions of bondage,
discipline, and sadomasochism, Illouz shows that these are as much a cultural fantasy as a sexual one,
serving as a guide to a happier romantic life. The Fifty Shades trilogy merges romantic fantasy with self-help
guide—two of the most popular genres for female readers.
 
Offering a provocative explanation for the success and popularity of the Fifty Shades of Grey novels, Hard-
Core Romance is an insightful look at modern relationships and contemporary women’s literature.
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From reader reviews:

Jeremy Smith:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book titled Hard-Core Romance:
"Fifty Shades of Grey," Best-Sellers, and Society? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You realize beside
you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it has the
opinion or you have some other opinion?

Jeffrey Osburn:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not demand people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a book
can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specially this Hard-Core Romance: "Fifty
Shades of Grey," Best-Sellers, and Society book because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course
the knowledge in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Warren Zeigler:

Many people spending their time by playing outside with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Hard-Core Romance: "Fifty
Shades of Grey," Best-Sellers, and Society which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this
book? Let's view.

Steven Atkins:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This e-book Hard-Core Romance: "Fifty Shades of Grey," Best-Sellers, and Society was
filled in relation to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines
competence. Some people has different feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit from a
book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that
you wanted.
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