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A twenty-year veteran of the classroom, elementary school teacher Phillip Done takes readers through a
lively and hilarious year in the classroom. Starting with the relative calm before the storm of buying school
supplies and posting class lists, he shares the distinct personalities of grades K-4, what he learned from two
professional trick or treating 8-year-old boys, the art of learning cursive and letter-writing, how
kindergartners try to trap leprechauns, and what every child should experience before he or she grows up.

These charming, sweet, and funny tales of Mr. Done's trials and triumphs as an award-winning schoolteacher
will touch readers' hearts and remind them of the true joys of childhood. We all have that one special,
favorite grade school teacher whom we fondly remember throughout our adult lives - and every teacher also
has students whom they will never forget. This is the perfect book for teachers, parents, and anyone else who
is looking for a lighthearted, nostalgic read.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Gillon:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different
content. As it is known to us that book is very important for people. The book Close Encounters of the
Third-Grade Kind: Thoughts on Teacherhood was making you to know about other knowledge and of course
you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The publication Close Encounters of the
Third-Grade Kind: Thoughts on Teacherhood is not only giving you more new information but also for being
your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your reserve. Try to
make relationship using the book Close Encounters of the Third-Grade Kind: Thoughts on Teacherhood.
You never experience lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Sylvia Dozier:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will get
lots of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will probably unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your
spare time, the particular book you have read will be Close Encounters of the Third-Grade Kind: Thoughts
on Teacherhood.

Vera Harris:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
easier to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically
the book that recommended to your account is Close Encounters of the Third-Grade Kind: Thoughts on
Teacherhood this e-book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This specific
book was represented how do the world has grown up. The language styles that writer use to explain it is
easy to understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this book
acceptable all of you.

Kristopher Lewis:

Beside this specific Close Encounters of the Third-Grade Kind: Thoughts on Teacherhood in your phone, it
might give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you
may got here is fresh from the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow village. It
is good thing to have Close Encounters of the Third-Grade Kind: Thoughts on Teacherhood because this
book offers to your account readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you would not get what



it's exactly about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here
cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this book and
read it from right now!
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