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STEVEN PRESSFIELD IS WRONG - not everyone is a warrior. But those of us who are can indeed
benefit from developing a strong Warrior Ethos; one that acknowledges diversity and is based on solid
principles of firmness, fairness, and dignity towards our fellow warriors - and our adversaries. 

Written by a Marine officer, this alternative Warrior Ethos is intended primarily for men and women in
uniform, but its core principles can be applied by leaders from all walks of life, and anyone who wants to
develop in themselves the qualities of Experience, Empathy, Example, Education, and Empowerment. 

This book calls upon historical wisdom of Herodotus, Plutarch and Thucydides along with the modern
observations of John Keegan, Michael Ignatieff, Lieutenant General Victor "Brute" Krulak, and others to
debunk the misogynistic and backwards-looking nature of Pressfield's 2011 book, and to provide a better
moral compass than the honor-bound, shame-based relic of dead cultures that he has offered up as a template
for our young women and men in uniform.
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From reader reviews:

Irma Kellner:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Steven Pressfield's "The Warrior Ethos": One Marine Officer's
Critique and Counterpoint. Try to the actual book Steven Pressfield's "The Warrior Ethos": One Marine
Officer's Critique and Counterpoint as your friend. It means that it can being your friend when you truly feel
alone and beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book
makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me make new
experience and knowledge with this book.

James Murray:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take
a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book eligible Steven
Pressfield's "The Warrior Ethos": One Marine Officer's Critique and Counterpoint? Maybe it is being best
activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have other opinion?

Anita Cannon:

The book Steven Pressfield's "The Warrior Ethos": One Marine Officer's Critique and Counterpoint gives
you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable far more increase.
Book can for being your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem using your subject. If you
can make studying a book Steven Pressfield's "The Warrior Ethos": One Marine Officer's Critique and
Counterpoint being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own personal capable,
increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You could know everything if you like open up and read
a reserve Steven Pressfield's "The Warrior Ethos": One Marine Officer's Critique and Counterpoint. Kinds of
book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about
this publication?

Gary Spengler:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what yours problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to perform others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They need to answer that question
mainly because just their can do in which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it
is correct. Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular Steven Pressfield's "The



Warrior Ethos": One Marine Officer's Critique and Counterpoint to read.
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