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MEMS for automotive and aerospace applications reviews the use of Micro-Electro-Mechanical-Systems
(MEMS) in developing solutions to the unique challenges presented by the automotive and aerospace
industries.

Part one explores MEMS for a variety of automotive applications. The role of MEMS in passenger safety
and comfort, sensors for automotive vehicle stability control applications and automotive tire pressure
monitoring systems are considered, along with pressure and flow sensors for engine management, and RF
MEMS for automotive radar sensors. Part two then goes on to explore MEMS for aerospace applications,
including devices for active drag reduction in aerospace applications, inertial navigation and structural health
monitoring systems, and thrusters for nano- and pico-satellites. A selection of case studies are used to
explore MEMS for harsh environment sensors in aerospace applications, before the book concludes by
considering the use of MEMS in space exploration and exploitation.

With its distinguished editors and international team of expert contributors, MEMS for automotive and
aerospace applications is a key tool for MEMS manufacturers and all scientists, engineers and academics
working on MEMS and intelligent systems for transportation.

Chapters consider the role of MEMS in a number of automotive applications, including passenger safety●

and comfort, vehicle stability and control
MEMS for aerospace applications are also discussed, including active drag reduction, inertial navigation●

and structural health monitoring systems
Presents a number of case studies exploring MEMS for harsh environment sensors in aerospace●
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From reader reviews:

Mary Edick:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or details even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Mems for Automotive
and Aerospace Applications (Woodhead Publishing Series in Electronic and Optical Materials) is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in
this era.

Arthur Elsberry:

This book untitled Mems for Automotive and Aerospace Applications (Woodhead Publishing Series in
Electronic and Optical Materials) to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that is because when
you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail
outlet or you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason
to your account to past this e-book from your list.

Christine Hook:

Mems for Automotive and Aerospace Applications (Woodhead Publishing Series in Electronic and Optical
Materials) can be one of your basic books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away
because this book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to put every word into
satisfaction arrangement in writing Mems for Automotive and Aerospace Applications (Woodhead
Publishing Series in Electronic and Optical Materials) nevertheless doesn't forget the main point, giving the
reader the hottest along with based confirm resource data that maybe you can be considered one of it. This
great information can certainly drawn you into fresh stage of crucial thinking.

Christopher Bohner:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt this when they get
a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book Mems for Automotive and Aerospace
Applications (Woodhead Publishing Series in Electronic and Optical Materials) to make your current reading
is interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise is developing when you like reading. Try to choose easy
book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book and examining especially. It is to be
initially opinion for you to like to open up a book and examine it. Beside that the e-book Mems for
Automotive and Aerospace Applications (Woodhead Publishing Series in Electronic and Optical Materials)
can to be your brand-new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing



of their time.
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